
Anointing Fire Catholic Ministries (AFCM) 

Anointing Fire Catholic Ministry (AFCM) is a Catholic charismatic missionary movement founded by Rev. 
Fr. Xavier Khan Vattayil for the world evangelization. Rev.Fr. Xavier Khan Vattayil is a member of the 
Diocese of Palghat in India and the founder and director of Anointing Fire Catholic Ministries. AFCM is a 
Charismatic Evangelization Community of Priests, Religious and Lay Ministers, working for the renewal of 
priests, nuns and lay people across the world. Preachers of Divine Mercy (PDM) is a congregation for 
priests, Abhishekagni Sisters of Jesus and Mary (ASJM) is a congregation for religious sisters, founded by 
Rev, Fr. Xavier Khan Vattayil. AFCM spreads the Gospel by serving as a torchbearer to millions through 
various social media outlets and languages brought about through the inspirations of the Holy Spirit, 
glorifying God in all and through all. AFCM communities are formed by group of families joined in prayer 
for evangelization. These are local communities with the blessing of the local Bishop and under the 
direction of local Spiritual Director, work together discerning the inspirations from the Holy Spirit. 

GLOBAL PRESENCE 

Started in a remote village in South India, AFCM Communities are now present worldwide: 42 states in 
America, Canada, 10 countries in Europe, 8 countries in Asia, Australia & South America. 
 

AFCM Canada 

Anointing fire catholic ministry officially started in Canada in the year 2016 September, under the spiritual 
guidance of Rev.Fr. Dominic Kootiyaniyil SDB. We started as an intercessory prayer group and later in the 
year 2017 October, AFCM Canada actively started its outreach missions under the spiritual Guidance of 
Rev. Fr. Sebastian Arikat. Since then, AFCM Canada is actively conducting prayer meetings, retreats and 
daily intercessory prayers for adults, youth and children. 
 

VISION 

 The Vision of this ministry is to see the members of the chucrch come closer to the Holy Catholic Church. 
We believe that God will use us and all the ministries he has raised up to bring his children to the table to 
feast with him. 

MISSION 

World Evangelization through the spiritual renewal of families and catechism to young adults, Supporting 
and helping the local parishes where ever the ministry members are present.  

A Brief History 

In 1998, Rev. Fr. Xavier Khan Vattayil, began the renewal ministry and Fr. Soji Olickal, Fr. Reni Pullukalayil 
and Fr. Binoy Karimaruthinkal joined to serve this ministry over the course of time. Through their 
ministry, thousands of missionaries became active in this mission all over the world. By 2014, all 
missionaries were united in one coordination by the name of Anointing Fire Catholic Ministry. Fr. Xavier 
Khan Vattayil is the Founder and the Director of AFCM, while Fr. Soji, Fr. Reni and Fr. Binoy are co-
founders. 

His Excellency, Most Rev. Jacob Manathodath, the Bishop of Palghat Diocese is the patron of AFCM. 

 



Ministries working under AFCM Canada 

1.AFCM Outreach Ministry - Conducts Parish retreats in English in various parts of Canada.AFCM English 
outreach ministry also conducts weekly International Maranatha retreat enriched with word of God and 
Eucharistic adoration via Zoom, YouTube live and Facebook live. 

2. AFCM Youth Ministry - Conducts prayer meeting every day morning, and weekly International AGAPE 
prayer meeting in Zoom, Youtube live and Facebook live. 

3. AFCM Teens Ministry - Conducts prayer meetings and Bible study every Saturday. 

4. AFCM Pre-Teens and Little Angels Ministries - Conduct prayers with online bible related activities, 
praise & worship, action songs and Holy Rosary ( ages 4 to 12). 

5. Kingdom Revelator - A Catholic magazine for young people. 

6. Little Evangelist- A Christian magazine for children. 

7. Vianney Mission – Prays for the Pope, Bishops, Priests and Seminarians. 

8. Intercession Ministry – Coordinates all intercession prayers of all ministries and initiate special and 
occasional intercessory prayers and intentions. 

9. Media Ministry – Prepare flyers, promo materials, live streaming of retreats and events. 

10. AFCM Book Ministry - Distributes of Bible, Kingdom Revelator Magazine, prayer books, spiritual books, 
religious articles and prayer cards. 

Visit Us: www.afcmcan.org 

www.afcmglobal.org 

 

For More information please contact:  Joemon Joseph- National Co-Ordinator AFCM Canada . 

Email:joe.maranatha22@yahoo.com cell: 647-909-0930 

For references please contact: Rev. Martin Varghese Cherumadathy, C.F.I.C. 

Pastor Epiphany of Our Lord Parish 3200 Pharmacy Avenue Scarborough M1W 3J5   

Phone.416-499-2196 Cell:416-525-1226 

 

 

http://www.afcmcan.org/

